
$415,000 - 2546 Stormy Cir, Navarre
MLS® #648112

$415,000
4 Bedroom, 2.00 Bathroom, 2,103 sqft
Residential on 0 Acres

Harvell's Crossing, Navarre, FL

Beautiful home with several amenities in
Navarre! Located in Harvellâ€™s Crossing off
E Bay Blvd, the property showcases a fenced
backyard with several fruit trees, fire pit, a
custom brick BBQ smoker that has cooked
some of the most amazing meat, sprinkler
system with lawn pump, & an open patio with
remote Sunset awning. The interior features
vaulted ceilings, hardwood floors, an office/flex
space, and new tile & vanity in the full
bathroom. The kitchen includes stainless steel
appliances, granite countertops, ceramic tile
flooring, upgraded cabinets & kitchen island.
Separate from the other bedrooms, the
ownerâ€™s suite has a double vanity, two
walk-in closets, & a garden tub in ownerâ€™s
bathroom. The property is located within 6
miles of Navarre Beach & within 16 miles of
Hurlburt Field.

Built in 2010

Essential Information

MLS® # 648112

Price $415,000

Bedrooms 4

Bathrooms 2.00

Full Baths 2

Square Footage 2,103

Acres 0.25

Year Built 2010



Type Residential

Sub-Type Single Family Residence

Style Contemporary

Status Active

Community Information

Address 2546 Stormy Cir

Subdivision Harvell's Crossing

City Navarre

County Santa Rosa

State FL

Zip Code 32566

Amenities

Parking Spaces 2

Parking 2 Car Garage

Garage Spaces 2

Has Pool Yes

Pool None

Interior

Interior Features Ceiling Fan(s), Chair Rail, Vaulted Ceiling(s), Walk-In Closet(s), Office/Study

Appliances Electric Water Heater, Built In Microwave, Dishwasher, Double Oven,
Refrigerator

Heating Central

Cooling Central Air, Ceiling Fan(s)

Fireplace Yes

# of Stories 1

Stories One

Exterior

Exterior Features Barbecue, Fire Pit, Lawn Pump, Sprinkler

Lot Description Interior Lot

Windows Shutters

Roof Shingle, Hip

Foundation Slab

School Information

Elementary Eastbay K-8



Middle EASTBAY K-8

High Navarre

Additional Information

Zoning Res Single

Listing Details

Listing Office Rob Brooks Realty
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